
38	 Government Notices 2025�

Government Notice No. 8 of 2025

THE NATIONAL WAGE CONSULTATIVE COUNCIL ACT

Regulations made by the Minister under sections 8 and 23 of  
the National Wage Consultative Council Act 

1.	 These regulations may be cited as the National Minimum Wage 
(Amendment) Regulations 2025.

2.	 In these regulations –

“principal regulations” means the National Minimum Wage 
Regulations 2017.

3.	 Regulation 3 of the principal regulations is amended –

(a)	 in paragraph (1), by deleting the words “16,500 rupees” 
and replacing them by the words “17,110 rupees”;

(b)	 in paragraph (3)(a), by deleting the words “Workers’ Rights 
(Additional Remuneration) (2024) Regulations 2024” and 
replacing them by the words “Workers’ Rights (Additional 
Remuneration) (2025) Regulations 2025”.

4.	 The Schedule to the principal regulations is amended –

(a)	 in Part I –

(i)	� in the heading, by deleting the words “1 JANUARY 
2024” and replacing them by the words “1 JANUARY 
2025”;

(ii)	 in items 1 and 2, by deleting the words “16,500 
rupees” and replacing them by the words “17,110 
rupees”;

Veemul iMac4/Govt Notices/2025/The NMW_Amd Reg 2025 
1st Proof: 17.01.24-Mins/SLO/ 2nd proof: -SLO



	 Government Notices 2025� 39

Veemul iMac4/Govt Notices/2025/The NMW_Amd Reg 2025 
1st Proof: 17.01.24-Mins/SLO

Veemul iMac4/Govt Notices/2025/The NMW_Amd Reg 2025 
1st Proof: 17.01.24-Mins/SLO/ 2nd proof: -SLO

Veemul iMac4/Govt Notices/2025/The NMW_Amd Reg 2025 
1st Proof: 17.01.24-Mins/SLO/ 2nd proof: -SLO

(b)	 in Part III –

(i)	 in the heading, by deleting the words “1 JANUARY 
2024” and replacing them by the words “1 JANUARY 
2025”;

(ii)	 by deleting the words “16,500 rupees” and replacing 
them by the words “17,110 rupees”.

5.	 These regulations shall be deemed to have come into operation 
on 1 January 2025.

Made by the Minister on 16 January 2025.


